
 

FINAL EVALUATION REPORT 

    (As Per Rule 35 of PP Rules-2004) 

 

1. Name of Procuring Agency                                  :      National Bank of Pakistan 

2. Method of Procurement                                               :      Post Pre-Qualification of bidders under PPRA Rule 15 & 16 and Subsequent 

                                                                                                procurement under PPRA Rule 36 (a) - Single Stage Single Envelope Procedure                                                                                                            

.                                                                                               from Prequalified bidders 

3. Title of Procurement                                             :     PROCUREMENT OF OUTSOURCED SUPPORT SERVICES 

4. Tender Inquiry No : NT-06/10/2025-1 

5. PPRA Ref. No. : TS564208E 

6. Date & Time of Bid Submission : December 22, 2025,10:00 AM 

7. Date & Time of Bid Opening :  December 22, 2025,10:30 AM 

8. Number of Bids Received : 02 bids for (Lot-1) 04 bids for (Lot 2,3&6) 05 bids for (Lot 4,5&7) 

9. Criteria for Bid Evaluation : Mentioned in the Standard Bidding Document 

10. Details of Bid(s) Evaluation         :     As follows 

 

Lots Regions Participants Bids 
Most Advantageous 

Bidders 

Most Advantageous 

Bid (in Percentage) 

Lots 1 Baluchistan 
M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd        = 0.34%   

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0.000025% 

M/s. Pak Multi Services 

Pvt. Ltd 
0.000025% 

Lots 2 Sindh -1 

M/s. FSC Integrated Services Pvt Ltd = 4.45%  

M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd = 0.34%  

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0% (Not 

considered as per Clause 15.3 of the SBD) 

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. = 0.25% 

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 0.25% 

Lots 3 Sindh -2 

M/s. FSC Integrated Services Pvt Ltd = 4.65%  

M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd = 0.34%  

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0.33%  

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. = 0.25% 

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 0.25% 

Lots 4 Punjab 1 

M/s. FSC Integrated Services Pvt Ltd = No 

Financial Bid submitted on EPAD  

M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd = 0.34%  

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0% (Not 

considered as per Clause 15.3 of the SBD) 

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. = 0.25%  

M/s. E.E Management Services Pvt Ltd = No Bid 

Securing Declaration was submitted  

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 0.25% 

Lots 5 Punjab 2 

M/s. FSC Integrated Services Pvt Ltd = 4.74%  

M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd = 0.34%  

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0% (Not 

considered as per Clause 15.3 of the SBD) 

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. = 0.25%  

M/s. E.E Management Services Pvt Ltd = No Bid 

Securing Declaration was submitted  

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 0.25% 

Lots 6 
Islamabad 

capital 

M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd = 0.34%  

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0.000025%  

M/s.Outriders Pvt Ltd = 1.71%  

M/s. E.E Management Services Pvt Ltd = No Bid 

Securing Declaration was submitted  

M/s. Pak Multi Services 

Pvt. Ltd 
0.000025% 

Lots 7 KPK Province 

M/s. Icon Consultant Pvt Ltd = 0.34%  

M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd. = 0.000025%  

M/s.Outriders Pvt Ltd = 1.47%  

M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt Ltd = 0.25 % 

M/s. E.E Management Services Pvt Ltd = No Bid 

Securing Declaration was submitted  

M/s. Pak Multi Services 

Pvt. Ltd.  
0.000025% 

 

Most Advantageous Bidder: Lot 1- M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd 

Lot 2- M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 

Lot 3- M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 

Lot 4- M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 

Lot 5- M/s. Bulls & Bulls Pvt. Ltd. 

Lot 6- M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd 

Lot 7- M/s. Pak Multi Services Pvt. Ltd 

 

 

 

 

        Divisional Head(A) 

        Procurement Division 

        Logistics, Communications & Marketing Group 

        Head Office, NBP, Karachi. 

 

 


