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INVITATION FOR BID 
 

National Bank of Pakistan intends to invite bids for the following works from pre- qualified contractors 
of National Bank of Pakistan of reputed firms/ contractors having relevant work experience in 
Construction, Interior decoration and design of Banks Financial Institutions / Autonomous 
Organizations / Multinational companies & registered with Income Tax and Sales Tax Departments & 
Pakistan Engineering Council for Serial No.1 to 5 in Category “C-6” or above. And for Serial No.6 in 
Category C-5 or above .The tenders would be issued after checking their credentials. 
 
1. RENOVATION WORKS OF NBP DUDYAL BRANCH (A.K MIRPUR REGION). 

 

2. RENOVATION WORK OF NBP BARNALA BRANCH (A.K MIRPUR REGION). 
 

3. RENOVATION & REFURBUISHMENT WORK OF NEW NBP BRANCH KASHMOR 
CANTT.UNDER ABEP-2015 (LARKANA REGION). 

 

4. RENOVATION & REFURBUISHMENT WORK OF NEW NBP BRANCH AT MAIN BAZAR 
HUBCHOWKI (GWADAR REGION). 

 
5.  REFURBUISHMENT WORK OF NBP MAIN BRANCH SHIKARPUR (OWN) PREMISES AT 

LARKANA REGION. 
 

6. CONSTRUCTION OF NBP HUB HITE BRANCH BUILDING (GAWADAR REGION). 
 
 
Bidding Documents, Containing detail terms and conditions, method of procurement, procedure for 
submission of bids, bid security, bid validity opening of bid, evaluation criteria, clarification /rejection 
of bids, performance guarantee etc are available for the interested bidders at the office of Deputy 
Chief Engineer, Engineering Wing, 3rd floor, NBP, Head Office Building , I.I. Chundrigar Road 
Karachi during office hour from today on wards on any working day up to 21/01/2016 after paying a 
tender fee for Serial No.1 to 5 of Rs. 1000/= (non refundable) in favor of Deputy Chief Engineer 
National Bank of Pakistan and for Serial No.6 Tender Fee of Rs. 5000/-.(non refundable) in favor of 
M/S Zaheeruddin Consultants (Pvt)Ltd. 
 
The bids, prepared in accordance with the instructions in the bidding documents must reach at the 
office of the Deputy Chief Engineer, Engineering Wing 3rd floor NBP Head Office Building I/I 
Chundrigar Road Karachi on or before 22/01/2016 at 15.00 hours a Bids will be opened on the same 
day at 15.30 hours in the presence of tender opening committee and contractors, who wish to be 
participated in case bid submitting / opening day is declared a holiday / strike, the same will be 
opened /submitted on next working day. 
 
An earnest money amounting to 2% of the tender amount in the shape of PAYMENT ORDER /CDR 
or Bank Guarantee of scheduled bank in the name of the Deputy Chief Engineer NBP must 
accompany each tender. This advertisement is also available on NBP & PPRA web sites. 
 
Please Note that only registered suppliers, who are on Active Tax payer List (ATL) of FBR, are 
eligible to supply / services to Government departments. 
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